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Jetway Broadband Pvt. Ltd.

Original Copy

TAX INVOICE
2020210712

Invoice Date : 07 Jul 2020
\

JETWAY BROADBAND INDIA PVT. LTD. Bill To:
' A 1/A, Kailash Commercial Complex, SOUTH INDIAN DEGREE

Shiv Dham, Near Welfare Centre,
Ambernath (East), Dist. Thane, COLLEGE
Maharashtra 421501 A Billing Address

. 49193260 44066 Sices degree college Jambul Phata

@ contact@jetwaybroadband.com Chikloli Ambernath (W) 421501

@ www.jetwaybroadband.com
GST No. 27AADC)4848D1ZK @ Installation Address
SAC Code : 998422 Sices degree college Jambul Phata
CIN No. : U74999MH2015PT(C262832 Chikloli Ambernath (W) 421501
PAN : AADC)4848D

~ & 9552599201
@ sicesdegreecollege@gmail.com
GST No. N/A p
Sr.No Product / Service Name Quantity  Unit Price Amount
4 JB‘S_UL_BMbpS_3Mth (07-07-2020 to 05-10-2020) 1 6300 6800.00
(sices_college)
AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY SUBTOTAL : ¥6800.00
GST (18%)

CGST(9%) : T 612
SGST (9%) : T 612
TOTAL AMOUNT : ¥ 8024

Bank Details:

Bank of Maharashtra
Ambernath Branch
Account No. : 60210136638
IFC Code : MAHB0000145

https://support.jetwaybroadband.in/invoice.php



Phone : 0251-2682355 / 2685267

SOUTH INDIAN CHILDREN'S EDUCATION SOCIETY

“and beh/

m Subhash Wadi, Ambarnath - 421 505. Dist - Thane, Maharashtra.
~S Regd. under Societies Registration Act. XXII of 1860 No. 3375 dt. 9-12-1955
and under Bombay Public Trust Act XXIX of 1950 at the Public Trust

Registration office Gr. Bombay Region No. F 41 Thana, dt. 26-8-1955
E-mail : sicesociety@rediffmail.com

S.IC.E.S/ 085 /2019-20
Ref. No. | "Date @3-\ &\ 9

M/s. Raj Computers
Shop no 2, Shivroad near,
MSEB Ulhasnagar,

o Thane(Dist.) - 421001

&)

Name of work : Quotation for complete Internet WIFI connection at Degree

College Naac.
Ref : Your Quotation No.Nil. Dated 19

Dear Sir,

The undersigned is pleased to inform you that the above subject offer submitted
by you is approved and accepted by the managing committee meeting, being the lowest, and
as such detailed work order is hereby placed with you as described below, adhering to below
mentioned general terms and conditions.

Sr. No. Description of work QTY Amount
1 TPLINK Archer C6 AC 1200 wireless MU-MIMO .
Gigabit 750 mbps router 01 2300/-
2 | .Cat6 cable for internet connection 01 14/-
3 Installation charges 01 1200/-
+ GST 18% -

Terms and conditions :
1) Above rate is Exclusive of all taxes & other charges.
2) Work should be carried out as per the direction and instruction of our representatives.
3) Payment to be made after inspection of the completed work done by the party as Per
the given instruction.
If you are agreeable and adhering to above terms and conditions,
kindly acknowledge the receipt of this work order and carry out the work at the earliest.

Thanking you,
Yours faithfully,

THE S.1.0. EBUSAT'™ $ACCTY AMBARNATH

. C)\pa) ' (\,‘/L\ Q@ For S.I.C.E. Society,

g Subhash Wadi, Ambarnath.
asurer .

'é\” -\(Ples ent _ - Secretary

e




From:
Alisha Almeida <Alisha.Almeida.HEYWEY @tatatel.co.in> | Add to Address book | This is spam
To: ‘"latishbhatia@rediffmail.com" <latishbhatia@rediffmail.com>

Subject: Re: Tata Internet Lease Line

Date: Sat, 7 Mar 2020 15:13:27 IST

Cc: Anand Upadhyay <Anand.Upadhyay@tatatel.co.in>


https://f4mail.rediff.com/ajaxprism/showaddrbook?action=showaddcontactfrm&name=Alisha%20Almeida%20&emailid=Alisha.Almeida.HEYWEY@tatatel.co.in&els=c00a8b3dce48805f4a12589e604e5e29
https://f4mail.rediff.com/ajaxprism/handlespam?action=isspam&fromemail=Alisha.Almeida.HEYWEY@tatatel.co.in&filename=1616838207.S.68134.Z.30172.H.WUFsaXNoYSBBbG1laWRhAFJFOiBUYXRhIEludGVybmV0IExlYXNlIExpbmU_.RU.rfs345,rfs345,921,458.f4-234-156.old&folder=Inbox&SrtFld=0&SrtOrd=1&startcount=0&msgcount=15&els=c00a8b3dce48805f4a12589e604e5e29

Dear Latish,
Please find below our proposal for ILL:

Address: SI.C.E.C.S COLLEGE AMBERNATH

Product Bandwidth Annual Charges | OTC SLA/Lockin
Period
ILL 100 mbps 10 lac 10 k 12 months

*Subject to feasibility and capex cost.
Kindly confirm to proceed further.
Thanks & Regards,

Alisha Almeida

7718006116

From: Alisha Almeida

Sent: 27 March 2021 12:47
To: latishbhatia@rediffmail.com

Cc: 'Anand Upadhyay' <Anand.Upadhyay(@tatatel.co.in>

Subject: Tata Internet Lease Line

Dear Latish,
As discussed,
Please confirm the Name and address for ILL 100 mbps bandwidth required so we can check.

Tata Teleservices Ltd


https://f4mail.rediff.com/ajaxprism/writemail?mode=mail_to_individual&email=latishbhatia@rediffmail.com&filename=1616838207.S.68134.Z.30172.H.WUFsaXNoYSBBbG1laWRhAFJFOiBUYXRhIEludGVybmV0IExlYXNlIExpbmU_.RU.rfs345,rfs345,921,458.f4-234-156.old&folder=Inbox&els=c00a8b3dce48805f4a12589e604e5e29
https://f4mail.rediff.com/ajaxprism/writemail?mode=mail_to_individual&email=Anand.Upadhyay@tatatel.co.in&filename=1616838207.S.68134.Z.30172.H.WUFsaXNoYSBBbG1laWRhAFJFOiBUYXRhIEludGVybmV0IExlYXNlIExpbmU_.RU.rfs345,rfs345,921,458.f4-234-156.old&folder=Inbox&els=c00a8b3dce48805f4a12589e604e5e29




